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Bella Swan's parents have arranged for her to marry Edward Cullen.She is being forced against her own
will and moves to live with him.Will she be able to go through with the marriage?And more importantly,
will she end up loving Edward?Set in 1921.
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The Life I Live Now
Chapter 1

1921
As I walked into the foyer, I saw my parents exchange a glance. I could tell there was something going
on between them, a secret that they were not telling me. I had been out all morning, running errands for
my parents, in our little town of Forks. I have lived here my whole life, but could not wait to get out here.
Something strange was going on, they seemed nervous and scared. I looked around the room
wondering what could be causing them distress.

That was when I saw him, a man stood next to them. The man was tall with bronze hair and a chiseled,
pale face. He was very handsome and I wondered what he was doing in my house. That's when he
looked up, and I saw his dazzling emerald green eyes. I could not stop looking into those eyes, I felt like
he could see into my soul and I could see into his.

“Isabella,” my mother, Renee's, voice made me look up. “This is Edward Cullen. I'm so sorry sweetie,
we should have told you sooner. You probably hate us now-”

“What is going on? Why is Edward here? Why would I be mad at you?” I asked. I had no idea what was
going on and had so many questions.

“Bella,” my father, Charlie, said carefully, trying to sound soothing. “Edward is here because we have
arranged for you to marry him. We arranged this a long time ago and we are so sorry that we didn't tell
you sooner, honey. We thought we would have more time.”

I was in shock. How could they do this to me? How could they have arranged for me to marry a stranger.
“Why didn't you tell me? How long has this been arranged?” I couldn't believe that this was happening.

“We made an arrangement with Edward's parents, Carlisle and Esme, when you were very young. They
are a wealthy family and we wanted to make sure that you would have a good future. I know we should
have told you, but there was never a good time...” She trailed off. I couldn't believe what she was
saying.

They were expecting me to leave my life behind, all my friends and family, to get married to a stranger. I
did not know if I could do what they were asking. Edward looked older than me and he was gorgeous. I
had always seen myself as an average, ordinary girl. I have plain brown hair and chocolate brown eyes.
I have pale, ivory skin. There was nothing special about me, I had always done average in school, never
being the smartest or the dumbest person in class. So why would someone as breathtakingly beautiful
as Edward, want to be with me? That is when I realised that he was probably being forced into this as
much as I was.

“No, I will not marry a complete stranger,” I heard myself say. I saw the look of complete shock on their



faces, and their sadness at my reaction.

“Mom, dad...please.” I begged, not knowing how to get out of the situation. I didn't want to get married, I
was only 18, especially not to someone I don't even know.

“Bella, as your parents it is our right to choose who you shall marry. Edward Cullen is a more than
suitable choice and he can take good care of you. You are going whether you want to or not. Now go
pack your bags.” I was surprised at my father's words. He barely ever spoke with such authority.

I decided to do as I was told. I ran up the stairs, while tears started rolling down my face. I couldn't
believe my parents hadn't told me that I had been promised to someone. I started stuffing everything into
a bag. I didn't want to leave, yet I felt like I had to get away from my parents. I didn't have many clothes,
or anything else for that matter, so it only took me a few minutes to pack my bags. I was just putting the
last of my things into a bag when I heard a knock on the bag.

“Come in,” I called out. I heard the door open slightly and felt someones eyes on me. I turned around to
see my mother standing in the doorway. I saw the tears streaming down her face. I ran into her arms for
what might be the last time.

“I am so sorry sweetie,” she cried.

“It's okay, mom. I will be okay,” I mumbled. We stood there weeping for a few minutes. When I
eventually pulled back, I saw the sorrow in my mother's eyes at me leaving. She helped me finish
packing and we carried the bags down the stairs. I said my goodbyes to my parents and promised to see
them soon, while Edward carried my bags out to the coach. After saying goodbye I walked outside trying
to prolong my time at the only home I knew.

Edward was putting the last of my bags into the coach when I got there. I watched him sadly. Was this
the man I was going to spend the rest of my life with? Who I was going to grow old with? Did my parents
think I would grow to love him or did they just want me to be miserable for the rest of my life? I had lived
in Forks my whole life. Where were we even going to live? Edward looked up at me, smiling weakly.

“Are you ready to go, Isabella?” he asked politely. His voice was amazing and beautiful. I nodded, not
knowing if I could speak without bursting into tears. He helped me into the coach, then climbed in next to
me.

“Where are we going?” I asked when I knew I could speak.

“Seattle” he replied, glancing at me to see my reaction. I was surprised that he actually considered my
opinion on where we were going to live. We sat in silence for a while. He eventually broke the silence.

“I'm so sorry, Isabella. I know that this is very hard for you, having to move to a new place with a
stranger, not knowing anyone.” he actually seemed generally sorry and concerned.

“Call me Bella please. It's not your fault and I'll be fine, I was just a bit surprised that my parents hadn't
told me,” I lied. “So what is going to happen now? I mean when are we going to get...you know...
married?”



I looked down, as I felt my cheeks turn bright red, as I struggled to say the words. It was so
embarrassing to talk about marrying a complete stranger. I could not believe I did not even know when
my own wedding would be. I did not even know who would be attending.

“I have been advised not to tell you anything about the wedding,” he laughed. “My sister Alice will be
helping you plan the wedding. She says that I am to have nothing to do with the planning and for me not
to try to influence you to use any of my ideas.” By now he was chuckling.

“What are your wedding ideas?” I asked out of curiosity, smiling kindly at him.

“Well, if it was up to me, I would have a small wedding with only close friends and family attending.”
That surprised me, it was the exact opposite of what I presumed he would want, it was exactly what I
wanted. I looked up and noticed him staring at me, causing me to blush as I looked into his mesmerising
eyes. What was he thinking? Probably that he couldn't believe that he had agreed to go along with
marrying someone like me. Someone who was completely ordinary, nothing special at all. Whereas he
was the most handsome, beautiful man I had ever seen.

“We should be there in a few hours, Bella.” he announced, looking away from my eyes. I nodded,
looking out the window of the coach. I shivered as I felt the cold wind through the window. I was
exhausted from the days events, so I decided to sleep for the rest of the journey. As I started to fall
asleep I felt Edward gently pull me closer to him. I was too tired to respond, as I drifted into
unconsciousness.
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Chapter 2

“Bella?” An angel's voice called my name. Was I dead? As my eyes fluttered open, I saw a man
shaking me awake. I immediately jumped backwards, out of his arms. Where was I and who was this
man that was awaking me? Then I remembered what had happened, I had fallen asleep in the coach
with my...fiance, Edward.

“Sorry, you just startled me,” I explained.

“My apologies Bella, but we have arrived,” he said, getting out of the coach. He helped me get out as
well. He was a complete gentleman.

As my feet touched the ground, I looked up and gasped as I saw the house we were in front of. It was so
beautiful, and so....big! It was a huge white manor, with big glass windows. It was surrounded by trees,
and was on a large piece of land. I was overwhelmed.

Suddenly I was knocked over by something soft, before I could fall an arm reached out to catch me.
When I looked up I saw a tiny pixie-like girl standing in front of me, and Edward was holding me up. As
soon as he saw that I was stable he let me go, I felt my face blush.

“Alice,” I heard Edward growl at the girl. She had short black hair and was tiny. She was absolutely
gorgeous. She had a huge smile on her face and was jumping up and down excitedly.

“You must be Bella! I'm Alice, Edward's sister! I have been so excited to meet you and now you are
finally here!” the girl babbled as I tried to understand what she was saying. “Come on, we need to start
planning the wedding! I was thinking that we could do a traditional wedding with-”

“Alice, do you think Bella should meet the rest of the family before you scare her away,” Edward
interrupted her. Alice pouted at her brother, begging for him to change his mind. He just looked away
and started to lead me inside. “Sorry about Alice, she gets a bit overexcited. You will get used to it.”

I smiled up at him. “It's fine, it's sweet that she cares so much.”

I looked up as we walked inside the house, it was so big and open. He was watching my reaction to
everything, smiling at my awe. Two people, who must be his parents, walked in, smiling at us.

“You must be Bella. It is so good to finally meet you. I am Carlisle Cullen, and this is my wife Esme.” the
man said. I could see where Edward and Alice got their good looks from, they were all breathtakingly
beautiful.

Carlisle looked so young, he had blonde hair and a perfect, pale complexion. He looked like most girl's



dream man. Esme had a heart-shaped face and long caramel coloured hair. Her complexion was just as
perfect as her husbands. They seemed very compassionate and welcoming.

I smiled at them, “It's a pleasure to meet you.”

“Where are Rosalie and Emmett?” Edward asked.

“They went into town to get some things, they should be back soon.” Esme replied.

“Would you like a tour of the house, Bella?” Edward asked politely.

“Okay” I murmured.

He led me through the house, showing me each room. There were three stories, my room was on the
second story. As I opened the door, I let out a gasp of shock. It was incredibly beautiful, yet so simple.
The walls were a cream colour and the floors were polished wood. There were windows along one of the
walls, showing the amazing view of the surrounding forest.

There was a huge four-poster bed against one of the walls, and a dresser with a mirror above it. There
was also a huge built-in closet, when I looked inside it I realised it was filled with clothes. I gasped and
stepped back from the closet. I turned to look at Edward, a look of utter disbelief on my face.

“Alice,” Edward explained simply. I looked back at the closet wearily, how many clothes did she think I
needed?

“Would you like to see my room?” Edward asked timidly.

“Sure,” I answered shyly, following him out of the door. He led me upstairs to the third story, there was
only one door up there. He led me upstairs to the third story, there was only one door up there. As we
walked into his room I was astonished. He had a huge four-poster bed with a gold coloured comforter
set. On the opposite side of the room was a black couch, with gold cushions.

There was also an ensuite bathroom and a wardrobe on the same wall as the door. There were large
windows on the wall opposite me, there was also a desk covered in books and music records. Beside
the music records was a Victrola. I looked back at Edward, he was staring at me to see what I thought.

I smiled at him and he smiled his crooked smile at me. I looked up into his dazzling eyes, unable to look
away. He stared back into mine, like he was trying to read something in them.

That is when I heard the door crash open. We were both startled by the sound, and turned around
quickly. Alice was standing in the doorway. A devious smile spread across her face, as she started
towards me.

“Come on, Bella! We need to start planning the wedding! Oh I'm so excited,” she trilled, while pulling
me out the door. She was surprisingly strong for such a tiny girl. I looked back at Edward as I was
dragged out of the room, he had an apologetic look on his face. That was when I knew that whatever
Alice was going to do to me was not something that I would enjoy.
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